Council Chamber

Ann Arbor, Mich., July 17, 1922. placement of sanitary Regular Session.

Meeting called to order by Ald. av. to Church-st.

Sugden, President pro tem.

Johnson, Present: Ald. Graf, Henderson, Lucas, White, Markey, Moore, Spathelf, Freeman, Lutz, Norris, Pres. Sugden. 14.

Minutes of previous meeting ap-

proved.

Communications. From the Mayor.

July 17, 1922.

the Honorable, To the Council.

Gentlemen:

I respectfully announce the pointment of Mr. Don E. Moe apspecial policeman at Bathing Beach at request of Board of Park Commissioners.

Respectfully submitted,

Geo. E. Lewis, Mayor. that

Moved by Ald Norris, pointment be confirmed.

Adopted by following vote: Yeas, Ald Johnson, Haarer, Graf, Hen-Hen-Markey, Groves, Lucas, White, Moore, Spathelf, Freeman, Lutz, Pres. Sugden, Norris, Nays, none.

Mayor Lewis announced the pointment of Mrs. Rena V. Fields and Mrs. J. H. Cissell as members

of Market Committee.

From Board of Public Works. To the Board of Public Works, Ann Arbor, Mich.

Gentlemen:

approxi-I submit the following mate estimate of the cost of the resanitary from placement sewer Uni-Washington-st., south across versity property to the intersection of E. University-av. ,and Washtenaw-av. Plans and specifications are on file in my offce.

Labor and materials\$4,811.20

Engineering and contingen-

481.12 cies

\$5,292.32

University of Michigan agrees to pay 54 per cent of the cost which amounts to \$2,857.85, which would leave the cost to the city, \$2,434.47.

Respectfully submitted,

Geo. H Sandenburgh, City Engineer.

To the Board of Public Works, Ann Arbor, Mich. Gentlemen:

I submit the following

mate estimate of the cost of the resewer Washtenaw-av., from E. University-Plans and specifications are on file in my office Haarer, Labor and materials\$2,700.00 Groves, Engineering and contingen-

> ciees 300.00

> > \$3,000.00

Respectfully submitted,

Geoe. H. Sandenburgh,

City Ergineer. Board of Public

Approved by Works, July 14, 1922.

Common (Council action.)

Referred to Sewer Committee.

(From Board.)

City Engineer presented tion of bids received on Sewers July 14, 1922.

Patrick Ryan, jr., Bay City, Brooks-st. storm sewer, \$4.748.40: Miller-av. and Seventh-st. Lateral sewer No. 112, \$1,483.10; John-st. Lateral sewer, No. 113, \$664.70: Fourth-av. storm sewer, \$275.00. Waller, Detroit, Brooks-st. L. L. storm sewer, \$5,369.20; Miller-av and Seventh-st. Lateral sewer No. 112, \$1,628.10; John-st. Lateral No. 113, \$737.11; Fourth-av. Lateral sewer. sewer. \$246.00.

Watson & Nickoloff, Pontiac, Brook-st. storm sewer, \$6,632.50; Miller-av Seventh-st and Lateral sewer No 112, \$1,969.00; John-st. Lateral sewer No. 113, no bid; Fourth-av. storm sewer, no bid. Michael & Co., Sturgis, Brooks-st. storm sewer, \$6,713.90; Miller-av. and Seventh-st. Lateral sewer No. 112. \$2,238.60; John-st. Lateral sewer No. 113, \$825.18; Fourth-av. storm sewer \$246.00.

Halpin & Reilly, Toledo, Brooksst. storm sewer, \$7,680.10; Miller-av. and Seventh-st. Lateral sewer No. 112, \$3,005.00; John-st. Lateral sew-113, No. 1,170.60; Fourth av. storm sewer, no bid.

Engineer's Estimate, Brooks-st., \$5,851.00; Miller-av. storm sewer, and Seventh-st. Lateral .sewer No. 112, \$2,695.00; John-st. Lateral sew-No. Fourth-av. 113, \$819.60; storm sewer, \$250.00.

Moved by Mr Scott, that all bids for construction of storm sewer on Fourth-av. be rejected and Board requests permission of Council proceed with construction of same. (Council action.)

Moved by Ald. Lutz, that action of Board in rejecting all bids for a approxi- storm sewer on Fourth-av. be

curred in and request to proceed storm sewer with construction granted.

Adopted by following vote: Yeas, Ald. Johnson, Haarer, Graf, Henderson, Lucas, Groves, Markey, Spathelf, Moore, Freeman, White, Norris, Pres. Sugden, Lutz, Nays, none. (From Board.)

Moved by Mr. Atwell, that Board Moore, Spathelf, White, recommends to Council the award- Lutz, Norris, Pres. S ing of contract to Patrick Ryan, jr., of Bay City, for construction

on Brooks-st. Lateral sewers in Districts Nos. 112 and 113.

(Council action.) Moved by Ald. Henderson that recommendation of Board be concurred in

Adopted by following vote: Yeas, Ald. Johnson, Haarer, Graf, derson, Lucas, Groves, Markey. Freeman, Sugden. Nays, none. of (From Board.)

BIDS RECEIVED ON **JULY 14.** CONTRACTOR GROUP I. GRO Washed Screened Washed Sc Mich. Const. Co.8205.90 10419.30 Patrick Ryan8733.70 8273.5511055.60 Coleman & Harding9229.91 8158.9711670.84 1 Rennie & Stieger No Bid No Thos Hessian No Bid No TIBITED

			UNIT
	GR	OUP I.	$_{ m GRO}$
*	Washed	Screenéd	Washed Sc
The section of the se	St. Cir.	St. Cir.	St. Cir. St.
Mich. Const. Co	.85 .85		.85 .85
Patrick Ryan	.90 1.00	.85 1.00	.90 1.00 .85
Coleman & Harding	.95 1.06	.84 .95	.95 1.06 .84
Rennie & Steiger			
Thos. Hession			
Engineers Est	.75 .90		.75 .90

ing of contract to Michigan Con-derson, Lucas, struction Co., of Detroit, for com- Moore, Spathelf, White, struction of all curbs and gutters Lutz, II and III, included in Groups I, using washed gravel. (Council action.)

that Ald. Johnson, by recommendation of Board be concurred in.

Adopted by following vote: Yeas, Ald. Johnson, Haarer, Graf, Henderson, Lucas, Groves, Moore, Spathelf, White, Markey. Freeman, Norris, Pres. Sugden, Lutz. Nays, none. (From Board.)

Moved by Mr. Scott, that Board recommends to Council that tract be awarded to Patrick Ryan, jr., of Bay City, for construction of all curbs and gutters included in Groups IV and V using washed gravel.

(Council action.)

Moved by Ald. Moore, that recommendation of Board be concurred in. water main on Morton-av., received

Moved by Mr. Atwell, that Board Adopted by following vote: Yeas, recommends to Council the award- Ald. Johnson, Haarer, Graf, Hen-Markey. Groves, Freeman, Norris, Pres. Sugden, Nays, none. (From Board.)

> By Mr. Reule, resolved, that width of pavement on Packard-st. from Granger-av. to city limits be thirty-eight feet. (Council action.)

Moved by Ald. Henderson, that resolution of Board be concurred in.

Adopted by following vote: Yeas, Ald. Johnson, Haarer, Graf, Henarer, Groves, Main Freeman, 14. derson, Lucas, Groves, Moore, Spathelf, White, Lutz, Norris, Pres. Sugden. Nays, none.

Petitions.

Of. Geo. J. Burke, et al., for sanitary sewer on Dexter-av and Geo. J. Burke, et al., for sanitary sewer on Charleton-av. and Abbottst., received and referred to Sewer Committee.

Of M. A. Lowman, et al., for

42.00

75.00

19.50

ices

......

M. J. Orbeck, services... R. W. Preston, services...

ing

Washtenaw Post, printing

C. Splitt, burial dogs....

John Travis, burial dogs.

2.25

5.00

.50

	11, 1000
Chas. Henning, labor 130.00	Louise Malloy, sa ary 55.00
Burroughs Adding Ma-	Russe l Pryce, salary 55.00
chine Co., attention ma-	Wm. Groves, salary 50.00
chine, etc 6.15 P. B. Harding, repairs. 2.25	
P. B. Harding, repairs 2.25	
Total supplies, etc\$1,105.37	aries\$ 603.64 Burroughs Add ng Mach.ne
Total supplies, etc	Co., supplies\$ 4.44
Contingent Fund total in-	Binkham & Taylor sup-
cluding salary\$2,422 69	plies 119 75
Fine Fund	S. C. Andres, supplies 92
Chas. Andrews, salary\$ 95.16	Staebler & Co., supplies. 13.72
Eugene Williams, salary 81.48 Ralph Edwards, salary, 81.48	ee Dackas,
Ralph Edwards, salary. 81.48 Henry McLaren, salary. 77.65	
Jacob Gw.nner, salary 77.65	., .,
Frank Markey, salary 74.64	
Herman Kruse, salary 74.64	John J. Sauer, supplies. 2.50
Em l Damann, salary 74.64	The Mayer-Schairer Co.,
Mat. Heininger, salary . 74.64	supplies 50
Foyd Nay.or, sa ary 74.64	Jno. C. Fischer Co., sup-
Earl Arnold, salary 74.64	
Fred Norman, sa ary 37.32	
Benj. Zahn, salary 74.64 Henry Nevroth, salary 74.64	
Henry Nevroth, salary 74.64 Raymond Gillespie, salary 74.64	
Arthur Cark, salary 67.96	CO
Clyde Carpenter, salary. 67.96	The Detroit Ed son Co.,
Chas. Carroll, salary 42.61	light and power 1,129.25
	City of Ann Arbor, serv-
Fire Fund total salaries	ices 49.90
1-2 month July\$1,301.03	Mich gan State Telephone
Police Fund Thos. O'Brien, sa ary\$ 95.16	Co., services 83 06
1-100. 0 2-1-11, 20 3 1	Ann Arbor Railroad Co.,
W. J. Aprill, salary 74.64 Ed. Blumhardt, salary 74.64	
Frank Keih l,salary 74.64	Water Works Dept. ex-
Marlend Howard salary 74.64	penses, 59.07
Chas. Splitt, salary 74.64	
Joseph Gast, salary 74.64	Total supplies, etc\$1,642.77
Geo. Rande, salary 74 64	L. Gerrick, abor \$ 45.10
Jacob Andres, salary 74.64	C. Agosta, labor 50 00
Louis Fohey, salary 74.64	
Chas Kapp, salary 74.64 John Osborn sa'ary 67.96	T. Schwab, labor 50.00 T. Landicini, labor 47 50
John Osborn, sa'ary 67.96 Carl Arnold, salary 29.83	J. Walls, labor 42.50
Armora, Salary 20.00	P. Ratti, labor 36.00
Police Fund total sa'ar-	J. Marro, labor
ies 1-2 month July\$ 939.34	S. Judge, labor 40.50
Cemetery Fund	S. Thrasher, labor \dots 13.50
Jno. C. Fischer Co., re-	P. Harfman, labor 42 75
pairs\$ 2.00	A. Glausnapp, labor 47.50
Wolf & Colvin, repairs35	C. Sauer, labor 45.00
Cemetery Fund total \$ 2.35	Total labor \$ 555.85
Street Lighting Fund	——————————————————————————————————————
The Detroit Edison Co.,	Water Works Fund total
light\$1 804.95	including salaries\$2,802 26
Water Works Fund	Park Fund
Harry Willsher, salary \$ 64.62	Paul April, labor\$ 21.15
Emanuel Sodt, salary 77 55	Carrol Benz, labor 55.00
Fred Linde, salary 68.75	Fred Biggs labor 48.60
Robt. Rowe, salary 51.70 Robt. Young, salary 48.47	K. A. Blumer, labor 3.60
A. E. Hawkes, salary 55.00	Geo. Boynton, labor 6.90 Wa'ter Clark labor 60.00
Cliff Shetterly, salary 77.55	Walter Clark labor 60.00 C. C. Fin'ey, labor 34 43
	o. o. rin cy, labor

COMMON	COUNC	L-JULY 17, 1922	409
P. J. Gilbert, labor	50.00	Ed. Schweickert, labor	40.00
Joseph Grant, labor	35.10	Carl Seeger, labor	38.25
Del. Hammond labor	38.60	Wm. Sterie, labor	44.10
Wilfred Hopper labor	270	Fred Urich, labor	75.20
John Howard, labor	23.25	Martin Walsh, labor	49.00
Margaret Jones, labor	3.90	Chas. Wayman labor	33.30
Robt. Mathias, labor	39.83	John Wendland, labor	33.95
Don Moe, abor	70.00	Joe Youngbauer, labor	39.15
Ezra Moore, labor	48.60	Geo. Zeifle, labor	29.10
John Morris, labor	$\begin{matrix} 36.00 \\ 5.10 \end{matrix}$	John Herrst, team	86.23
Geo. Pawlowski, labor Geo. Potter, labor	36.90	John Miller, team	67.11
Ed. Seeger labor	9.00	Carl Rehburg, team Nelson Turner, team	83.56
James Stephens labor	7.20		83.56 146.47
John Thomas, labor	55.00	Jacob Young, labor	140.47
Geo. Townley, labor	21.60	Total labor\$1	690 93
Max Tunnic ffe, labor	$\boldsymbol{7.25}$	The Troy Wagon Works	,000,00
R chard Wallaker labor	56.70	Co., supplies	170.72
Paul Way, labor	35.10	The Barrett Co., supplies	17.00
Wm. Hodson, team	44.00	Hydrau ic Hoist Mfg. Co.,	
		supplies	11.13
Tota' abor\$	855.51	S. C. Andres supplies	1.21
Mich State Te'. Co., rent-	= 9 0	Jno. C. Fischer Co., sup-	
al etc\$	7.38	plies	6.75
Water Works Dept., water	$\substack{1.50\\292.50}$	Hertler Bros., supplies	40 19
Henry S. Platt roadster. Hert'er Bros, supplies	$\frac{292.50}{3.40}$	Reule Con.in & Co., sup-	0.00
F. G. Hoag, supplies	$\frac{3.40}{1.00}$	ples	3.00
M. D Larned, supplies	1.00	The C. A. Sauer Co., Inc.,	584.77
The Mayer-Schairer Co.,	1.00	supplies Schumacher Hardware	384.11
sumples	1.75	Co., supplies	5.50
Geo. J. Moe, supplies	8.15	Staebler & Co., supplies.	1.00
The C. A. Sauer Co. Inc.	.120	Staebler Oil Co., supplies.	10.85
John J. Sauer supplies	39.16	Staeb er & Son, coal	52.54
Washtenaw Lumber Co,		We ssinger Sign Works,	
supp ies	8.48	sign	2.50
We'ss'nger S'gn Works,		David A Klins & Sons.	
supp'ies	2.75	gravel	786.00
J. M Woollomes, repairs	5.00	The Ohio & M chigan Sand	105.05
Mata: manailian t	979.97	& Gravel Co. supples.	185.65
Total supplies, etc\$	373.27	W. Corne l, repairs	$\substack{6.25\\10.53}$
Park Fund total\$	1 228 78	Hutzel & Co supplies Wolf & Co vin, supplies	$\frac{10.33}{24.85}$
L. G. Bird labor	68.25	D. J. & C. Railway freight	5.72
Francis Brokaw labor	16.00	D. J. & C. Hanway Treight	
John Brokaw, labor	39.15	Total supplies, etc\$1	,926.16
Wm. Cark, labor	36.00		
Mike Coste'o, labor	42.30	Street Fund to al\$3	,617.09
Walter Feldkamp, labor.	54.45	Bridge, Cul. & C. W. F	und
Gottlob Finkberner labor	$23\ 45$	Wm. Clark, 'abor\$	3.15
John Hanselman, labor	45.00	Adam Schlecht, labor	4.05
Ed. Hahn, labor	20.00	Ed. Schlecht labor	$\frac{4.05}{4.05}$
Fred Hanse man, labor	54.45	Carl Seeger labor	$\frac{4.05}{3.15}$
Emanuel Hozapfel, labor	40.50	Joe Youngbauer, labor	J.1 Ų
Sam Horning, labor Carl Janke, labor	$\frac{49.05}{32.25}$	Bridge Cul. & C. W.	
Sam Kalmbach, labor	$\begin{array}{c} 32.25 \\ 24.75 \end{array}$	Fund total\$	18.45
Mat Koch, labor	38.25	Recapitulation	
William Kuehn, labor	42.30	Contingent\$2	2.422.69
Fred Mack, labor	15.00	Fire 1	301.03
James Mason, labor	39.60	Police	939 34
Julius N mps. labor	42.30	Cemetery	2.35
Chas. Paul labor	48.75	Street Lighting 1	,804.95
Edw. Roehm, labor	31.00	Water Works 2	2,802.26
Adam Schlecht, labor	1.80		,228.78
Ed. Schlecht, labor	37.35	Street	3,617.09

Bridge Cul. & C. W.....

Total city funds\$14,136.94 Ann Arbor, Mich, Juy 17, 1922. To the Finance Committee of the Common Council:

Gentlemen:

accounts against the City of Ann Arbor and I hereby certify that they are correct to the best of my knowledge.

Isaac G. Reynolds. C ty Clerk.

To the Honorable, the Common

Counci'. Gentlemen

Your F nance Committee has reviewed the foregoing report. We recommend the same be approved and that warrants be ordered and that warrants drawn for the foregoing accounts.

Albert D. Groves, Robert Norris Mark B. Sugden, Finance Committee.

Ald. Groves moved the adoption of report, which was adopted by following vote: Yeas, Ald. Johnson, Haarer, Graf, Henderson, Lucas, Groves, Markey, Moore, Spathelf, White, Freeman, Lutz, Norris, Pres. Nays, none. Sugden, 14.

Ald. Groves presented City Engineer's estimates, which were ap- The Washtenaw Post — eight proved by Board of Public Works point type, price per inch of two-July 14, 1922, as follows: Golden-av., inch newspaper column. storm sewer, first estimate, Bartling 42c per inch; price per inch of 11-1-2 & Dull, contractors, amount due, ems set solid, 40c per inch; proceed-\$2,542.50; Sanitary sewer District ings in phamphlet form. price per No. 110, first estimate, Nickoloff, contractors, amount due. \$1,256.94; Pavement District No. 49, second estimate, Ann Arbor Asphalt Construction Co., contract-Ann Arbor ors, amount due \$3,184.20.

Moved by Ald. Groves, that estimates be allowed and City Clerk instructed to draw warrants for

amounts due.

Adopted by following vote: Yeas, of report, which was adopted by fol-Ald. Johnson, Haarer, Graf, Hen-lowing vote: Yeas. Ald. Haarer, derson, Lucas, Groves, Markey, Graf, Henderson, Lucas, Groves, Moore, Spathelf, White, Freeman, Norris, Pres. Lutz, Sugden, 14. Nays, none.

Finance Committee Report.

To the Honorable, the Common Council,

Gentlemen:

Your Finance Committee, to whom votes. was referred the rates for men's compensation insurance, re- By Ald. Norris, spectfully reports that the policy Be it resolved that the contract for carried with The Fidelity and Casprinting be awarded the Ann Arbor ualty Company of New York

18.45 pired on May 10, 1922, and to safeguard the city said policy was renewed, and we therefore recommend that said policy be continued for remainder of policy year and the matter of future insurance be referred to your committee so I have examined the foregoing may have ample time to give careful consideration before the policy expires next year.

Respectfully submitted,

A. D. Groves.

Chairman of Committee. Ald. Groves moved the adoption of report which was adopted following vote: Yeas, Ald. Johnson. Haarer, Graf, Henderson, Lucas, Groves, Markey, Moore, Spathelf, White, Freeman, Lutz, Norris, Pres. Sugden, 14. Nays, none.

To the Honorable, the

Council. Gentlemen:

Your Finance Committee has had under consideration the proposals for printing and publishing the proceedings of the Common and Board of Public Works and city notices for the year ensuing July 9, 1922, and said bids were as follows:

The Ann Times Arbor seven point type, price per inch of two-inch newspaper column, solid, 50c per inch; proceedings in pamphlet form, price per page, 50c.

Watson & page, two inch columns. 45c; price per page 111-2 ems columns 45c.

> Your committee recommends that an informal ballot be taken relative the awarding of contract.

Respectfully sul mitted,

A. D. Groves, Mark Sugden. Finance Committee.

Ald. Groves moved the Markey, Moore, Spathelf, White.

Freeman, Norris, Pres. Sugden, 12. Nays, Ald. Johnson, 1.

Ald. Lutz excused from voting. Informal ballot was taken:

Arbor Times News received seven votes and Washtenaw Post five votes. Ald. Johnson and Lutz ex-

work- cused from voting.

ex- Times News. Adopted by following

vote: Yeas, Ald. Haarer, Henderson, Lucas, Groves, Markey, Moore, Spathelf, White, Freeman, Norris, Fres. Sugden, 11. Nays, Ald. Johnson, Graf, 2.

Ald. Lutz excused from voting.

Sewer Committee Report.

To the Honorable, the Common Council,

Gentlemen:

Your Sewer Committee respectfully recommends as follows:

- That lateral sewers be constructed on Vinewood Boulevard from Wayne-st. to city limits, Dexter-av. from present sewer city limits, and on Charleton-av. and Abbott-st. from the west line Killins Heights addition about 234 feet west, and that the City Engineer be instructed to prepare plans, specifications and estimates of cost for said lateral sewers; and that the constructions of said sewers deemed and declared to be necessary public improvements.
- That the plans, specifications and estimates of cost of replacement sanitary sewer from Washing-University ton st. south across property to intersection of E. Uniersi y av. and Washtenaw-av. and for replacement sewer on Washtenaw-av. from E. University-av. to Church st. as approved by Bos of Public Works July 14, 1922, Board proved and the Board of Public Works be instructed to advertise for fids for construction of replacement sanitary sewer from Washington st. south across University property to intersection of E. University-av. and Washtenw-av. and proceed with construction of said sewer in accordance with communication from University of Michigan received April 17, 1922.

Respectfully submitted,

Ceo. Lutz, E. E. Lucas, Jerome W. Markey, Geo. L. Haarer, W. S. Moore, Alfred White,

Sewer Committee.
Ald. Lutz moved the adoption of report, which was adopted by following vote: Yeas, Ald. Johnson, Haarer, Graf, Henderson, Lucas, Groves, Markey, Moore, Spathelf, White. Freeman, Lutz, Norris, Pres. Sugden, 14. Nays, none.

Moved by Ald. Lutz, that petition of Bernard Harkins, et al., presented to Council June 19, 1922, to connect with proposed sewer extension to Fair Grounds, be granted; work to be done under supervision of City Engineer.

Adopted by following vote: Yeas, Ald. Johnson, Haarer, Graf, Henderson, Lucas, Groves, Markey, Moore, Spathelf, White, Freeman, Lutz, Norris, Pres. Sugden, 14. Nays, none.

Moved by Ald. Lutz, that Board of Public Works be asked to submit at next meeting plans, specifications and estimate of cost of sewer on Henry-st. Adopted.

Sidewalk Committee Report.

To the Honorable, the Common Council.

Gentlemen:

Your Sidewalk Committee respectfully recommends that the following sidewalks be ordered built, and the following resolution adopted:

Resolved, that the grading and construction of the sidewalks hereinafter mentioned is deemed and declare to be a necessary public improvement.

Therefore, it is hereby ordered that stone or cement sidewalk be graded, built and constructed in the City of Ann Arbor on and along the following property:

Lucinda Lovell 215 N. S ate st. Peginning at a point 40 ft. S of N. E. corner of lot 11, Maynard & Gruner Add., thence W. parallel to State st. 93.60 ft. S. 40 ft. E. 93.60 ft. to State st. N. 40 ft. to beginning.

Olive Aldrich. 215 N Sate st. Lo: 9 Bower's Add. except the N.

fractiona' part.

Old Ladies' Home, 410 N. State st. Land bounded E. by State st. N. by Kingsley st. W. by Spathelf land and S. by Beltz land.

O. K. Cummings, 537 N. State st. Lot 6 and the N. 41 links of lot 7 B "A" Eastern.

J. L. Rose. Property adjoining No. 537 on the North at follows: The E. 1-2 of lets 4 and 5 b "A" Eastern Add. excepting parcel in N. E. corner sold to Andrews and Harr, said parcel being about 20 ft. by 65 ft.

Frank Idziak, Ralph Swezey, 616 Fuller st. Beginning at an iron stake 35 ft. E. of the N. W. corner of the E 1-2 of lot 4 thence deflecting to the right 105 deg. 63.8 ft. thence deflecting to the left 90 deg. to W. 'ine of State st. Nly. along State st. to Fuller st. Wly. on Fuller st. to beg., all in B "A" Eastern Add.

Christian Woman's Board of Missions, 444 S. State st. Lot 9 B. 4 S. R. 9 East, Ann Arbor Land Co.'s Add.

F. M. Hamilton Est., 342 S. State st. The S. 23 ft. of lot 11, B. 3. N., R 9 East, Ann Arbor Land Co.'s Add.

Students' Christian Association. W. side of S. State st. Y. M. C. A. Lotts 6, 7 and 8, E, 2 S. R. 9 East.

Dr. V. C. Vaughn, E. side S. State et. 66 ft. Vaughn property. Lot 5, B. 2 S., P. 10 East, except the S. 22 ft. Eastern Add.

Carrie B. Sugden 117 N. State s'. West side. Lot 13 Assessor's Plat No. 8.

Frank and Elizabeth Payne, 127 N. State st.. West side. Lot 11, Assessor's Plat No. 8.

Lewis Vivian, 209 N. State st. The E. 1-2 of lot 10, Wilkinson's Plat.

Dr. D. E. Standish, 528 N. State st. The S. 40 ft. of the N. 46 ft. of lot 4 B "B" Eastern Add.

Willard Burris, 530 N. State st. The S. 32 ft. of lot 3 and the N. 6 ft. of lot 4 B "B" Eastern Add.

Chas. Preketes et al., E. side of S. State st. S. 66 ft Vaughn property. The S. 22 ft. of lot 5, B, 2. S., R. 10 E. Eastern Add.

Margaret Sullivan, 534 N State st. The N. 34 ft. of lot 3 B "B" Eastern Add.

Geo. Spathelf, 1001 Broadway. The S. W. 28 ft. 5 inches of the S. E. 40 ft. of lot 1 B 7, Brown & Fullers Add.

Clarence Cobb. 1003 Broadway. The N. W. 24 ft. of the S. W. 52 5-12 ft. of the S. E. 40 ft of lot 1 B 7, Brown & Fuller Add.

Geo. Spathelf. The N. E. 22 ft. of the S. W. 74 5-12 ft. of the S. E. 40 ft. of lot 1 B 7, Brown & Fullers Add.

The following walks on the East side of 8th st., Washington to and including Water Works property.

Aaron Widmayer. The W. 52 ft. of lot 28, Samuel P. Jewett's Add. Oscar Scherdt. The N. 44 ft. of

lot 32, Samuel P. Jewett's Add.

Otto Hack. The S. 22 ft. of lot 32 and the N. 22 ft. of lot 34, Samuel P. Jewett's Add.

Fred Breisch. The S. 44 ft. of lot 34, Samuel P. Jewett's Add.

Ann Arbor Water Co. Lots 83, 85 and 36, Samuel P. Jewett's Add. The following walks on the Eart side of First st. from John K. ave. to Mosley st.

John Volz. The E. 28 ft. of the N. 70 ft. of lot 8 B. 7 S., R. 1 and 2 East Wm. S Maynard's Add.

2 East, Wm. S. Maynard's Add. Andrew R. Peterson. The N. 1-2 of the following description, the S. 67 ft. of the E. 31 ft. of lot 8 and the S. 67 ft. of the W. 33 ft. of lot 7, B. 7 S., R. 1 and 2 East, Wm. S. Maynard's Add.

Andrew R. Peterson. The S 1-2 of the following description: the S, 67 ft. of the E. 11 ft. of lot 8 and the S. 67 ft. of the W. 33 ft. of lot 7, B. 7 S., R. 1 and 2 East, Wm. S. Maynard's Add.

John Koch. Lots 9 and 10, John

Koch's Sub. div.

The following walks on W. Washington st. from Ann Arbor Railroad to and including Petkins property:

Magdalena Rohde. Lots 2 and

3, Rohde Sub. div.

Ameli Klavit er. Lot 4, Rohde Sub. div.

M. J. Howard. Lot 5, Rohde Sub. div.

Sam Perkins. Lot 6, Rohde Sub. div.

The following walks on Krause st., S. s'de

Daniel Haas. Lot 14 and the N. 1-2 of lots 12 and 13, Krause Add. Chas. Wuerth. Lot 15, Krause Add.

E. J. Adams. Lot 13, Krau e Add.

Repairs

518-520 E. William st., repair drive.

508-510 E. William et., repair sidewalk.

414-416 Maynard st., repair and mop. wa'k.

433 Maynard st., repair an 1 mop. wa'k.

Zeta Psi Fra ernity, repair walk. S. side M. E. Church on Washington st., two blocks to be repaired.

City Work

A crosswalk across west end of Krause st.

Renair inter ections at N. W. corner State and Jefferson sts.

Fark Superintendent remove tree at 616 Fuller st.

C. C. FREEMAN, W. G. JOHNSON, W. S. MOORE BENJ. H. GRAF, GEO. LUTZ

WM.	L.	HENDERSON,
A. D.	GI	ROVES,

Sidewalk Committee.

Ald. Freeman moved the adoption of report which was adopted by fol-Yeas, Ald. Johnson, lowing vote: Haarer, Graf, Henderson, Groves, Markey, Moore, Spathelf, White, Freeman, Lutz, Norris, Pres. Sugden, 14. Nays, none. Moved by Ald. Freeman that the

Board of Public Works construct sidewalk in both sides of Old Ladies'

Home at expense of the city.

Adopted by following vote: Yeas, Ald. Johnson, Haarer, Graf, Henderson, Lucas, Groves, Markey, Moore, Spathelf, White. Freeman, Norris, Pres. Sugden, Lutz, Nays, none.

Railway Committee.

Ald. White made oral report meeting of Railway committee with officials of the Detroit, Jackson and Chicago Railway Company, relative to paying between and along raliway tracks and committee was given further time.

Bond Committee Report.

To the Honorable, the Common Council.

Gentlemen:

Your Bond committee has had the following bond under consideration and respectfully recommends its approval:

Plumber Bond. Arba M. Wilson, principal; John C. Wilson and W. J. Wilson, sureties.

Rsepectfully submitted, Benj. H. Graf, Jerome W. Markey, Bond Committee.

Ald. Graf moved the adoption of report, which was adopted by following vote: Yeas, Ald. Johnson. Haarer, Graf, Henderson, Lucas. Groves, Markey, Moore, Spathelf, White, Freeman, Lutz, Norris, Pres. Sugden, 14. Nays, none.

Special Committee.

Ald. Haarer, to whom was referred matter of dumping ground, made oral report that fence been removed from Crest ave. dumping ground and Mr. Henning was keeping it in good condition. Officer's Reports.

Treasurer's Report—City Funds. Receipts—

Contingent—Milk license \$63.00; peddlers' license \$238.00; dray license \$10.00; plumbers' license \$3.00; dog license \$17.50; city scales \$31.10; release of Com-

1	IL—JULY 17, 1922	413
	munity Park \$1.00; garbage settlement \$460.00;	
	fees \$165.08: int. on bank balance \$37.50\$ Cemetery—Sa'e of lot	826.18
	\$30.00; burial \$14.00;	
	care of lots \$7.00\$ Police—City fees \$74.05; fines \$75.00; storage	51.00
	\$10.00	159.05
	pair pavements \$14.31; treating streets \$2,-620.82; sale of calcium	
	chloride \$33.25\$2 Park—Spraying \$38.00;	2,683.38
	shrubs \$51.35; bathing \$155.75; concessions	270 10
	\$155.75; concessions \$25.00\$ Water Works General fund- Recev'd fr. Mgr. of	
	Dept\$11 Water Dept. Sinking fund—	1,475 33
	Rec'd fr. Mgr. of Dept. \$1 Uncollected City Tax—	1,500.00
	Personal taxes collected \$ Delinquent Tax— Rec'd fr. County Treas. \$5	
	Totals\$20 Overdrawn June 1,1922.	4,940.56
	Warran's paid 30	5,222.60 $6,117.45$
	Overdrawn July 1, 1922.\$20	0,894.85
	Di bursements— Contingent\$	7,660.72
	Cemetery	$203.25 \\ 2,937.99$
	Pol ^v ce Poor Poor	1,987.25 89.78
	Street 8 Park	3,606. 1 4
	Street light	1,811.84
	Sidewalk bui'ding Bridge culvert and cross-	.10
		$\begin{array}{c} 298.59 \\ 7,314.71 \end{array}$
	Water—(Hydrant, rental, etc.)	2,376.63
	Totals\$30	3,117.45
	On Hand— Contingent\$1	1,486.59
	Cemtery	$1,010.64$ $800\ 20$
	Police Park	897.79
	Sidewalk building Bridge, culvert and cross-	310.92
	walk	4.996.56

walk 4,996.56

Water Works

(completion) $\dots 10,506.02$

Water Works General fund 8,702.45

Special

414 COMMON COCING	1B 00B1 11, 102E
Water Dept. Sinking fund21,000.00	Dist. No. 98 225.68
210 511 5	Dist. No. 101 1,362.48
Totals\$49.7117	Dist. No. 102 631.93
Overdrawn—	Dist. No. 103 1,575.29
Fire Dept	Di t. No. 104
Poor	Dist. No. 105
Street	Dist. No. 107
Street light	Dist. No. 108
etc.) 5,758.65	Dist. No. 109 137.00
Uncol ected city tax 8,399.60	Totals\$14,772.49
Delinquent tax26,478.37	On hand June 1, 1922 2,414.89
Definquent tax	On mand dune 1, 1022 2,414.50
Totals\$70,606.02	On hand July 1, 1922\$12,357.60
Overdrawn June 1, 1922. 49,711.17	Overdrawn—
	Dist. No. 90\$ 302.82
\$20,894.85	Dist. No. 93
Warrants Outstanding—	Dist. No. 72 4.53
Contingent\$ 333.76	Dist. No. 82 909.37
Police 82.64	Dist. No. 86 96.67
Poor 2.99	Dist. No. 87 97.56
Street 1,199.65	Dist. No. 88 392.82
Park 51.59	Dist. No. 89
Bridge, culvert and cross-	Dist. No. 92 127.82
walk	Dist. No. 96 79.31
Water Work General fund 111.10	W-4-1-
Overdrawn July 1,1922.\$1,783.98	Totals\$2,414.89
SEWER FUNDS—	PAVEMENT FUNDS—
Receipts—	Receits—
Dist. No. 90\$ 186.16	Dist. No. 20\$ 24.74
Dist. No. 103 107.78	Dist. No. 28 19.99
Dist. No. 104 80.42	Dist. No. 30 5.81
Dist. No. 107 35.75	Dist. No. 36
	Dist. No. 44 29.43
Totals\$ 410.11	Totals \$ 108.10
On hand une 1, 192211 947.49	On hand June 1, 1922 . 10,070 64
On hand July 1, 192212 357.60	On hand June 1, 1922 . 10,010 04
On Hand—	\$10,178.74
Dist. No. 89 177.60	Warrants paid 1,305.75
Dist. No. 91	,
Dist. No. 94	On hand July 1, 1922 . \$ 8872.99
Dist. No. 95 922.32	Disbursements
Dist. No. 96 824.10	Dist. No. 48\$1,305.75
Dist. No. 97 1,239.54	
Dist. No. 98 133.18	Totals\$1,305.75
Dist. No. 99 120.17	On Hand
Dist. No. 100 75.86	Dist. No. 26\$ 199.63
Dist. No. 101 531.56	Dist. No. 32 46.08
Dist. No. 102 943.48	Dist. No. 33 100.54
Dist. No. 103 366.85	Dist. No. 34
Dist. No. 104	Dist. No. 36
Dist. No. 105	Dist. No. 37
Dist. No. 106	Dist. No. 38
Dist. No. 107	• • • • • • • • • • • • • • • • • • • •
Dist. No. 108	Dist. No. 41
Dist. No. 90	Dist. No. 43
Dist. No. 91	Dist. No. 45
Dist. No. 93	Dist. No. 46 668.70
Dist. No. 94 126.06	Dist. No. 47 897.60
Dist. No. 95 327.25	
Dist. No. 97 418.95	Totals\$18,151.94

On hand June 1, 1922 9,278.95	and forty-nine one hundredths dollars (\$10,048.89).
\$ 8,872.99 Overdrawn—	Yours very truly, FRED T. STOWE, Cashier.
Dist. No. 48\$1,305.75 Dist. No. 20	RECAPITULATION. Sewer funds on hand\$12 357.60
Dist. No. 27	Pavement funds on hand 8,872.99
Dist. No. 29 1,170.60	Curb and gutter funds on hand 9,956.87
Dist. No. 30	
Dist. No. 39	City funds overdrawn \$31,187.46 20,894.85
Totals\$9,278.95 CURB AND GUTTER FUNDS— Receip's—	On hand Ju'y 1, 1922\$10,292.61 F. & M. Bank balance\$10,048.89 Checks and cash in vault 244.72
Dist. No. 4	On hand Ju'y 1, 1922\$10,292.61 ROSS GRANGER, City Treasurer.
Tota's\$ 302.61	City Engineer's Report
On hand June 1, 1922. 9,654.26	To the Board of Public Works,
On hand July 1, 1922\$9,956.87	Ann Arbor, Michigan. Gent'emen:
On Hand— Dist. No. 2\$ 262,79	I submit the following report of the expenditures for work done
Dist. No. 3	under my direction during the
Dist. No. 4	month of June, 1922.
Dist. No. 5	Engineering and Clerical Work
Dist. No. 7 126.05	G. H. Sandenburgh\$247.71 E. R. Scovill 1,7.48
Dist. No. 1	V. W. McAdam 169.00
D's: No. 9	E. E. Disderide
Dist. No. 11 712.90	C W. Blashi 1 103.20
Dist. No. 12	Jim Acqui
Dist. No. 14	E. W. Littlefield 69 50
Dist. No. 15 958.00	J. W. Jantzen 64.75 E. D. Rentschler 63.00
Dist. No. 16	W. F. Niethamer 60 50
Dirt. No. 18	Roger Gleason 53.00
Dist. No. 19	Bernard Blashill
Dist. No. 20	Carl Vogt 18.00
Dist. No. 22 1,142.10	J. W. Phil'ips
Dist. No. 23 167.96	Herbert Hicks 15.00
Totals\$9,969.28	L. W. Millard
On hand June 1, 1922 12.41	Leo Tobin 8.00
On hand July 1, 1922\$9,956.87	J. A. Throp
Overdrawn—	Eugene Harbeck 2.00
Dist. No. 1\$12.41	C. W. Warner 200
Totals\$12.41	\$1,596.52 Sewer Work
Ann Arbor, Mich., July 5, 1922.	J. H. Sanderburgh\$ 2.29
This is to certify that Ross Gran-	H. R. Scovill 9.18
ger Treasurer of the City of Ann Arbor, had on deposit in this bank	H Steele 3.00
at the close of business June 30 the	John Brokaw 30.75
sum of ten thousand forty-eight	W. Weyman 25.65

416 COMMON COUNC	31L—JULY 17, 1922
James Mason	Works Fred J. Rentschier,
	Pres., Ann Arbor Michigan.
\$74.84	
1. Accounts\$ 1.14 2. Records	
3. Correspondence 7.17	
4. Reports, monthly 4.34	
5. Meetings, committee,	Scarifying streets 544.47
board etc 17.50	Grave ing and patching dirt
6. Inspect ng, plumbing. 14.52	streets 330.90
8. Information to the pub-	Spreading calcium ch or de
lie 41.48	on streets 167.75
12. Cleaning and arranging office 2.28	Grading sidewalks Jackson-
office	av, \$97.50; Dexter-av., \$266.90, Granger - av.,
partment 3.20	\$110.10; Day-st., \$36.71;
22. Sidewa'k grades 402.65	John K-av. \$91.90; John-
23 Curb grades 38.42	st., \$30.20 623.31
24. Street lines and grades 3.06	Grading Cambridge-rd. from
59. Vacation G. H. Sanden-	Washtenaw to Baldwn 170.20
burgh 45.66	Spreading oil on streets. 157.60
66. Directing work of department 58.22	Unloading bird's-eye gravel 130.60
partment 58.22 151. Packard St. pavement 3.82	Mowing weeds 141 93 Cleaning gutters 128.96
157. Housing Code 74 62	app'ying tarvia, X. C 105.90
189. Hill St. pavement 306.85	Grading streets. Allmen-
191. State-st. pavement 330.20	dinger Heights, \$100.56,
239. Shadford-rd. san. sewer 6.40	Lutz-av., \$26.05, Seventh-
244. Third-st. curb and gut-	st., \$31.76 158.37
ter 2.00 253 Woodward - Packard-	Grading streets
Wells - Forest Storm	Unloading calcium chloride 31.20 Making brooms 24.05
sewer 35.37	Constructing crosswalks and
255. Washington Hghts. san.	sidewalk extensions 367.05
sewer $\dots 5.40$	Unloading tiles for Broad-
281. Ann-st storm sewer 28 79	way sewers 10.80
282. Catherine St. storm	Filing washouts in dirt streets
sewer	streets 29 44 Cleaning n e s 24.00
	Repairing culverts So. 4th-
	av. E. University-av. &
\$1596.52	Oakland-av 9.90
10. Sanitary sewer main-	Miscellaneous — Un oading
tenance	hay \$.40; cleaning bo - er \$3.60; repairing Feder-
58. Tapping sewers 2.72	al truck, \$4.50; setting
\$74.84	parking s'gns, \$.80 9.30
Inspection	Pumping water from reser-
M, Fitzsimmons 72.12	voir at cemetery 7.80
J. W. Jantzen 2.56	Respectfully submitted.
M. J. Orbeck 57.70	A. J. Paul, Street Commissioner.
J. Lovell 62.50	Reports of City Treasurer, Clerk,
4104.00	Acting Marshal, Engineer and
\$194.88	Street Commissioner for month of
189. H'll-st. pavement 81.74 191. State-st pavement 110.58	June received and ordered to take
239. Shadford-rd sanitary	usual course.
sewer 2.56	City Attorney made oral report that request of Michigan State Tele-
	phone Company for increase in rates
\$194.88	in this city had been refused by
Respectfully submitted,	Public Utilities Commission and
Geo. H. Sandenburgh. City Engineer.	rates for residence houses ordered
Street Commissioner's Report	reduced.
July 1, 1922	Moved by Ald. Henderson, that City Clerk notify the Detroit,
To the Honorable Board of Public	Jackson and Chicago Railway Com-

pany to remove at once their pole on south side of William st., between Thompson and Maynaid sts., so that pole will be outside of sidewalk line.

Adopted by following vote: Yeas, Ald. Johnson, Haarer, Graf, Henderson, Lucas, Groves, Markey, Moore, Spathelf, White. Freeman, Lutz, Norris, Pres. Sugden, 14. Nays, none.

Dy Ald. Lucas:

Resolved, that the matter of insurance on city cars be referred to Board of Public Works with power to act.

Adopted by following vote: Yeas, Ald. Johnson, Haarer, Graf, Henderson, Lucas, Groves, Markey, Moore, Spathelf, White. Freeman, Lutz, Norris, Pres. Sugden, 14. Nays. none.

Pavement Boundaries and Order of Assessment

By Ald. Johnson.

Resolved, that the pavement on State street, from Huron street to Fuller street, known as District No. 48; that the pavement on Hill street, from Packard street Washtenaw avenue, known as District No. 49; that the pavement on Packard street, from Granger avenue to the city limits, known as District No. 50, within the city of Arbor, Michigan. heretofore ordered in the opinion of the Common Council are, and are hereby deemed and declared to be necessary public improvements.

Resolved, further that all the lands, tenements and premises, hereinafter mentioned, in each particular district are deemed and declared to be benefitted by the construction and competion of the respective pavement here ofore ordered, and is hereby ordered and determined that all 'he costs of the said respective pubic improvemens, street ntersect one and 20 per cent of the balance of the cost of said public improvements excepted, shall be and is hereby ordered to be levied on and assessed against the lands, tenements and premises situated in the respective special assessment tricts hereinafter designated, and the said special assessment districts are hereby fixed as follows, to-wit: All those certain pieces and parcels of land situated in the city of Ann Arbor, county of Washtenaw, state of Michigan, as follows:

Pavement Assessment District No. 48.

Lot 1 and 2 B 1 N. R. 10 E. Eastern addition.

Lot 8 and the south one half of lot 7, B 1 N, R 10 E. Eastern addition. The west 14 feet of the north 66 feet of lot 7 B 1 N R 10 E. Eastern addition.

af, HenMarkey, the west 22 feet of the south 66 feet
Freeman, of lot 2, B 2 N, R 10 E, Eastern addition. The south 56 feet of the
north 66 feet of lot 1 and the south
56 feet of the north 66 feet of lot
er of ineferred to
the power and the south 49 1-2 feet of lots 7
and 8, B 2 N, R 10 E, Eastern addition.
The north 10 feet of lot 1 and 2
and 8, B 2 N, R 10 E, Eastern addition.
The north 82 1-2 feet of lot 8
and the north 82 1-2 feet of lot 8
and the north 82½ feet of the west
Markey, 26 feet of lot 7, B 2 N, R 10 E,
Freeman, Eastern addition.

The south 63 feet of lot 1 and the south 63 feet of the west 21 feet of lot 2, B 3 N, R 10 E, Eastern addition. The south 36 feet of the north 69 feet of lot 1 and the south 36 feet of the west 29 feet of the north 69 feet of lot 2, B 3 N, R 10 E, Eastern addition. Lot 8 B 3 N, R 10 E, Lawrence and Maynards addition. The west 96 feet of 10. 7, B 3 N, R 10 E. Lawrence and Maynards addition.

The west 82½ feet of lot 1, lot 2, 3 and the west 82 feet of lot 4, B 4 N, R 10 E, Lawrence and Maynards addition.

Lots 1, 2, 3 and lot 4 except the east 8 feet, B 5 N, R 10 E, Lawrence & Maynards Addition. Lots 1, 2, 3, and 4, Bock B, Eastern Addition.

Lot 11, 12, 13 and 14 assessor's Plat 8. Lot 10 except south 30½ feet of the west 36 feet Wilcoxson Add. Lot 11, except a strip of land on the west end, 33 feet wide on the south line of said lot, 36 feet wide on the north line of said lot. Commencing at the intersection of the west line of N. State street with the south line of Catherine St. thence west along the south line of Catherne St., 93.60 feet; south 40 feet; east 93.60 feet; north 40 feet to the place of beginning, being part of lot 11, Maynard and Grueners Add.

Beginning at a point 40 feet south of the northeast corner of lot 11, Maynard and Grueners Add; thence west parrallel to Catherine St. 93.60 feet; thence south parallel to N. state St. to the north line of lot 10 Wilcoxsons Add; thence east along the north line of lot 10 Wilcoxsons Add. to the west line of N. State St.; thence north along the west line of N. State St. to the place of begin-

ning, part northeast ¼ section 29, Ann Arbor.

Commencing on the west line of State St. 66 feet north of the south-east corner of lot 9, Bowers Add; thence west to a point 10 feet east of lot 10; thence south parallel to the east line of lot 10 to the north line of Catherine St.; thence along the north end of Catherine St. to the west line of N. State St.; thence north along the west line of N. State St. to the place of beginning.

Commencing at the southeast corner of to 9 Bower add; thence west along the south line of said lo: 9, 81.08 fee; thence south 66 feet ; thence east to the west line of N. State St.; thence nor h 66 feet to the place of biginning. Lot 9. Bowers add except the west 34 feet of the north 17 feet of the east 51 fee of ot 8 Bowers Add. Lots 6 and 7 and the north 66 feet of 'ot 5 Bowers Add. Lots 2, 4, 6, 8, 10, 12 and 14 Swathel's Add. Lots 6, 7, 8 and 9. B k. A. Eas ern Add A tranquar parcel of and boundca on the east and south by North State S., on the west by Swathels Adl ad on the north by lot 9, Book A Fastern Addition.

The north 33 feet of lots 1 and 2. block 3 N, R 10 E, Lawrence and

Maynards addition.

That part of lot 5, block A, Eastern addition described as follows: Beginning at the northeast corner of lot 6, block A. Eastern Add.; thence northerly along the west line of N. State St. to the south line of Frank Idziak property; thence westerly parallel to the north line of said lot 6, to the west line of J. L. Rose property; thence southerly along the west line of J. L. Rose property to the north line of said lot 6, thence easterly along the north line of said lot 6 to the west line of N. State St., the place of beginning.

Beginning at the southwest corner of N. State St. and Kingsley St. thence west on the south line of Kingsley St. 82 feet; thence southerly along the east line of Anna Spathelf land to the north line of Abraham Beltz's land: thence easterly along the north line of Abraham Beltz land 82 feet to the west line of N. State St.; thence northerly along the west line of N. State St. to place of beginning, being part of the northeast one quarter of Section 29, Ann Arbor.

Pavement Assessment District No. 49.

Beginning at a point on Hill St. the S. line of Hill St. and the W.

49½ feet E of the intersection of Packard St. on Hill St. running thence N 132 feet, Swly. 123¾ feet to a point on Packard St., 41½ feet from the intersection of Packard St. and Hill St.; thence Ely along Packard and Hill Sts., to place of beginning, Maynard and Morgan Add.

The E 41 feet of the south 132 feet of lot 8 and the S 132 feet of the W 13 feet of lots 6 and 7, except the small NE corner of the same, B 7 S, R 9 E, Maynard and Morgans Add.

Part of lots 6 and 7, B 7 S, R 9 E Maynard and Morgans Add., beginning at a point on N line of Hill St., 51 feet W to its intersection with the W line of State St., N parallel to State St 72 feet W parallel to Hill St. 64 feet; S 86 feet; E on Hill St. 64 feet to beginning.

Part of lots 6 and 7, B 7 S, R 9 E, Maynard and Morgans Add. beginning on the NW corner of Hill and State Sts.; N 72 feet on State St.; W parallel to Hill St. 51 feet; S to

Hill St.; E to beginning.

Lots 6, 7, 8 and 9, B 7 S, R 10 E. Lots 7, 8, 9 B 7 S, R 11 E, also the S 46 feet of lot 6, B 7 S, R 11 E.

Lots 5, 6, 7, and 8 B 7 S, R 12 E. Lot 7 and lot 6 except the W 100 feet of the N 43 feet of B 7 S, R 13 E.

W 132 feet of S 33 feet of lot 8, B 2, R. S. Smiths Add. E 132 feet of S 52.3 feet of lot 8.

S 69 feet of lots 2 and 3 B 3, R. S. Smiths 2nd Add, lot 6 B 4, R. S. Smiths 2nd Add.. S 79 feet of lots 7 and 8 B 4, R. S. Smiths 2nd Add.

Lots 1 to 6 inclusive, Blk. 6, R. S. Smith 2nd Add except the north 73

feet of lots 1 and 2.

A parcel of land in Sec. 28 Ann Arbor bounded as follows: On W by R. S. Smiths 2nd Add; on south by Hill St. on the E by Adams land and Balaw as Picnic Grove Add; on the north by Baldwin's Picnic Grove Add. being 162 feet more or less on Hill St.

Lots 9, 10, 11, 12, and 13 Baldwins

Picnic grove Add.

A piece of land part of section 32 Ann Arbor 72.55 feet on Hill St., 82 feet on Packard St. and 58 feet N and S on the E line bounded N by Hill St; S by Seabolts land and E by Maas land; W by Packard St.

The W 33 feet of the E 99 feet of the N 58 feet of the Triangular

of the N 58 feet of the E 99 feet of the N 58 feet of the Triangular piece of land bounded by Hill St., State St. and Packard St., part of section 32 Ann Arbor.

Beginning at the intersection of

line of S. State St., thence W 66 feet; S 72 feet; E 66 feet; N on W line of State St. to beginning.

Lots 27 and N one half of lots

25 and 26 Tappan Park Add.

Lots 24 and N one half of lot 23 Tappan Park Add. part of lots 1, 22 and 23 Tappan Park, bounded on N by Hill St.; E by Shaw land; S by Nissly land and W by Nissly, Galbraith and Delta Building Co. land.

Beginning at the NW corner of lot 1, Tappan Park thence running Sly to SE corner of lot 24; thence in a straight line to a point 13 feet SW of the intersection of the SE line of lot 23 with said lot 1, SEly parallel to the NE line of lot 22, 32, 25; Ely to a point on the NW line of lots 22, 41.62 feet SE of the NW corner of lot 22 Ely 27.34 feet, to point on Sturtz W line 36.24 feet; Nly from the SW line of lot 2, Nly 138.69feet to N line of lot 1, 90.23 feet from beginning, W on Hill St. to beginning, except Ely portion sold to A. O. Lee.

Part of lots 1 and 2 Tappan Park Add beginning at the intersection of the S line of Hill St. and SW line of Tappan St: thence SE on Tappan St. 40.1 feet; SWly on Wly line of Cavanaughs land 117.63 feet; SWly to SW corner of lot 2, NW on SW Line of lots 1 and 2, 63.38 feet: Ely 27.74 feet to Shaw land 36 24 feet, NW of S line of lot 2, N 138.69 feet to point on Hill St. 74 feet W of NE corner of lot 1, E on Hill St. 74 feet to Leginning, also a strip off of the Ely and of lots 21 and 22.

Lots 1 to 7 inclusive Blk. 1 Hills Add.

N 92 feet lot 1 Blk. 2 Hills Add. Lot 2, Blk. 2 Hills Add. except the S 40 feet of the W 24 feet. Lot 24 Blk. 2 Hills Add. N 89 feet of lot 23 Blk. 2 G. D. Hills Add

N 124 feet lot 1 Blk 3, Hills Add. Lot 2 Blk. 3, G. D. Hills Add. except S 8 feet of W 16 feet. Lots 23 and 24 G. D. Hills Add.

Lots 2, 3, 4 and lot 1 except S 63 feet, Olivia Hills Add.

Lots 6, 7, 8, 9, and lot 10 except S 56 feet, Oliva B. Halls Add.

Beginning SE corner of Hill St. and Lincoln Ave; thence S. on E line of Lincoln Ave. 132 feet; E 99:98 feet; N 132 feet to S. line of Hill St.; W 99.98 feet to beginning.

A parcel of land 69.5 feet on S side of Hill St. by 200 feet deep N and S, bounded on the N by Hill St. E by Bigelow land, S by Drake land

Ann Arber; also a strip fronting 12 feet on Hill St. by 132 feet deep and adjoining the above description on the W.

Commencing at an iron stake on S line of Hill St., 2251-2 feet E from center line of Lincoln Ave. and Hill St.; thence SE along the E line of Sadler land, Drake land, Clark land, to a point 140 feet N of Cambridge Rd; thence E parallel to Cambridge Rd, $74\frac{1}{2}$ feet; thence N along W line of L. P. Halls land to Hill St.; thence Wly along the S line of Hill St. 74 1-2 feet to beginning.

Beginning at the intersection of the S line of Hill St. and SWly line of Washtenaw Ave; thence W on Hill St. 178.2 feet to Bigelows E line; thence S on Bigelows E lne to a point 140 feet N of Cambridge Rd; thence E Parallel to Hill St. to Cowies Wly line; thence Nly 70 feet; Ely 46 feet; Nly 129.9 feet; NEly to Clarks land, NWLY along Clarks SWly line to NW corner of said land; thence NEly 160 feet to point in W line of Washtenaw Ave. 86 feet SE of beginning; NWly 86 feet to beginning.

Beginning at the SW corner of Hill St., and Olivia Ave.; thence Wly along the S. line of Hill St. 77.46 feet; thence Sly parallel to Olivia Ave. 200 feet; thence Ely parallel to Hill St. 77.42 feet to the W line of Olivia Ave.; thence Nly along the W line of Olivia avenue 200 feet to place of beginning.

Pavement Asses-ment District No. 50.

Lots, 3, 4, 77 and 78 Granger and Bixby Add. Lots 1, 31, 32 and 33 W. H. Mortons 1st Add. Lots 1 to 9 inclusive Packard lawn Add. Also the following described property. Beginning at the southeast corner lot Packard Lawn Add.; thence southeasterly along the southwester-ly line of Packard St. 114.08 feet to the northeast corner of lot 4, Packard Lawn Add.; thence southwesterly along the north line of said lot 4; f∈et Packard Lawn Add. 132 the southwest corner of said lot 4; parallel northwesterly thence Packard St. 114.08 feet; thence northeasterly along the south line of lot 3 Packard Lawn Add. 132 feet to the place of beginning. A parcel of land 90 feet wide abutting on the northeast side of Packard St. between the south line of Shadford Rd. and the city limits.

Commencing at a point in W by Craig land, part of section 33 southwest line of Packard St. at

the intersection on the south line of to beginning, part of NE ¼ and Granger Ave.; thence southerly southwesterly line the Packard St. 31 feet; thence deflecting 101 deg. 57 minutes to the line. 86,05 feet; thence deflecting 19 deg. 20 minutes to line, 55.70 feet; thence deflecting 96 deg. 22 m nutes to 1 ne. 65.20 feet to the south line of Granger Ave; thence east on Granger Ave. 114 feet to beginning.

Beginning at a point in the southwesterly line of Packard St. 31 feet southeasterly from the intersection of Granger Ave.; thence southeasterly along Packard St., 65 45 reet; thence deflecting to the right 112 deg. 39 minutes, 116.58 feet; thence deflecting 103 deg. 58 minutes to the right 15 feet; thence deflecting 90 deg. 30 minutes to the left 57.84 feet; thence deflecting 91 deg. 30 minutes to the right 25 feet; thence deflecting 83 deg. 38 minutes to the right 55.7 feet; thence deflecting 19 20 minutes to the left 86.05 feet to place of beginning.

Beginning at a point in the southwesterly line of Packard St. 96.45 feet southeasterly of its intersection with the south line of Granger Ave.; thence southeasterly 83 feet west parallel to Granger Ave. 165 feet; North 40 feet; easterly 115 feet to

beginning.

Beginning at the northwest corner of Packard St. and Brooklyn Ave. west along Brooklyn Ave. 207.15 feet north at right angles. 56 feet easterly parallel to Brooklyn Ave. 164.67 feet southeasterly on Packard St. 69.45 feet to beginning a part of northeast ¼ and SW ¼ sec. 33, Ann Arbor.

Beginning at a point on the west side of Packard St. 72 feet and 2 inches north from the intersection of the south line of Grangers land with the west line of Packard St.; west parallel with the south line Grangers land, 122.15 feet: thence northerly at an angle of 91 deg. 31 m.nutes to said first mentioned line, 57.95 feet to the southerly line of Brooklyn Ave.; thence eastrly along Brooklyn Ave. 72.6 feet to Packard St.; thence south along Packard St. 72.2 feet to place of beginning.

Beginning at the intersection of the Wly line of Packard St. and SEly line of Eramus D. Nichols farm; Wly on said farm line 161.7 feet; north at right angles 57.95 feet east on Edward L. Jenkins line 122.15 feet; SEly on Packard St. 72.2 feet ments with interest be and the same

SW ¼ of sec. 33 Ann Arbor.

NE 132 feet of following described property: A parcel of land bounded N by Granger land, E by Packard St., S. by Packard Lawn Add., and W. by Hamilton, Rose and Sheehans Add.

Lot 1 Granger and Bixby Add. except the east 80 feet.

Lot 2 Granger and Bixby Add, except the north 10 feet of the east 80 feet.

Resolved, further, that this Common Council requires and orders the sum of twenty thousand dollars for District No. 48; the sum of twentyfour thousand three hundred sixtyseven dollars for district No. 49; and the sum of Thirteen thousand three hundred and thirty-three dollars for district No. 50; all payable in ten equal annual installments with 5 per cent interest, or, at the option of the taxpayers in one payment, to be raised by tax and a special assessment on and against the lots. parts of lots, lands, tenements in each district aforesaid and situated in the said respected special assessment district, as a tax against the owners thereof. All to be assessed on and against said lands, tenements and premises according to the benefits coming to each parcel thereof from such local public improvements, and the city assessor is herely required to levy and assess the said sums of money as aforesaid on and against the lands and tenements aforesaid, and on and upon the special assessment roll for the respective pavement district aforesaid, and on and upon each and every of the regular assessment rolls of the city of Ann Arbor for the year and during which any such special assessment may be payable until the whole of such special assessment shall be paid in full, all to be assessed in the manner and for the purpose aforesaid, pursuant to law.

Resolved, further, that the sum of ten thousand dollars for district No. 48; the sum of twelve thousand one hundred thirty-three dollars for district No. 49; and the sum of six thousand six hundred sixty-seven dollars for district No. 50; is hereby appropriated for the purpose of defraying the cost of such respective public improvements at street and alley intersections and twenty per cent of the balance of cost of said public improvements; all of which sums of money in ten equal annual installare hereby ordered and required to be levied, spread and assessed on and upon each and every of the regular annual assessment rolls of the City of Ann Arbor, and on and against all the taxable property within the said city, in and during the period in which any part of this appropriation and assessment is or shall be payable.

Resolved, further, that the city clerk do certify this determination and order of assessments to the city

assessor, pursuant to law.

Adopted by following vote: Yeas, Ald. Johnson, Haarer, Graf, Groves, Markey, Lucas, Moore, Spathelf, White, Freeman, Norris, Pres. Sugden, 14. Lutz, Nays, none.

Resolution Ordering Pavement Bonds.

By Ald. Haarer

Whereas, the Common Council has authorized the construction by the Board of Public Works of pavements known as North State Street Pavement, District No. 48, Hill Street Pavement, District No. 49; and Packard Street Pavement, District No. 50; and the Common Council having caused to be certified to the city assessor the lands, tenements and premises to be assessed for cost of said public improvements, street intersections and twenty per cent of the balance excepted, therefore be it

Resolved, and it is hereby ordered, that the mayor and city clerk are hereby authorized and required to sign and countersign respectively and execute, under their hands and the seal of the city of Ann Arbor, pavement bonds of the city of Ann Arbor under date of August 1st, 1922, as follows, to-wit: District No. 48, the sum of thirty thousand dollars (\$30,000.00); District No. 49, the sum of thirty-six thousand five hundred dollars (\$36,500.00); and District No. 50, the sum of twenty thousand dollars (\$20,000.00); that being the cost of said improvements, payable to bearer in ten equal annual installments from and after the first day of August, 1922, with interest at five per cent per annum, payable annually on the first day of August in each and every year, as evidenced by interest coupons to be thereto attached, bearing the printed or lithographed the signatures ofmayor and city clerk of the city of Ann Arbor, principal and interest to be payable at the office of the city treasurer City hall, Ann Arbor, Michigan.

Resolved, further, that said mayor and city clerk be and they are hereby authorized and directed to deliver said bonds, when executed, to the city treasurer, and that said bonds and coupons be in substantially the form for pavement bonds and coupons adopted by the Common Council August 4th, 1919.

Adopted by following vote: Yeas, Ald. Johnson, Haarer, Graf, derson, Lucas, Groves, Moore, Spathelf, White, Markey. Freeman, Lutz, Norris, Pres. Sugden.

Nays, none. By Ald. Moore:

Resolved, that the City make all necessary arrangements for the primary election to be held Sept. 12, 1922, and the general election to be held Nov. 7, 1922, which elections shall be held at the usual ward polling places from 7 o'clock a.m. until 8 o'clock p. m., central

standard time.

Resolved, further, that the Clerk make all necessary arrangements for registration to said elections and that registration shall be at the office of the Clerk during regular office hours; and that on August 19 and 26 and October 14 and 21, 1922, the office of the City Clerk shall be open from 8 o'clock a. m. to 8 o'clock p. m., for the purpose of registration and the City Clerk be authorized to appoint such deputies as may be necessary for registration and to properly comply with absent voters' law, such deputies to receive such compensation as the Finance Committee may determine.

Adopted by following vote: Yeas, Ald. Johnson, Haarer, Graf, derson, Groves, Markey, Lucas, Moore, Spathelf, White, Freeman, Norris, Pres. Sugden, Lutz, Nays, none.

By Ald. Spathelf:

Resolved, that the Board of Public Works be authorized to appoint Janitor for City Hall at salary \$90.00 per month.

Adopted by following vote: Yeas, Graf, Ald. Johnson, Haarer, Markey, Groves, derson, Lucas, Moore, Spathelf, White, Freeman, Sugden, Pres. Norris, Lutz, Nays, none.

By Ald. Markey:

the Mayor Resolved, that City Cleerk are hereby authorized to execute lateral sewer bonds lateral sewers in Districts Nos. 110 to 113 inclusive with interest at five per cent per annum, payable annually.

Adopted by following vote: Yeas, Ald. Johnson, Haarer, Graf, Henderson, Lucas, Groves, Markey, Moore, Spathelf, White, Freeman, Lutz, Norris, Pres. Sugden, 14. Nays, none.

Mrs. Charles Harmon called attention to fountain opposite Court On motio House being out of commission and adjourned. matter was referred to Street Commissioner.

The matter of waste paper at Curb market was referred to Market Committee.

The matter of providing a public lavatory was referred to Mayor Lewis.

Matters of repairs to fountain in City Hall was referred to Water Committee.

On motion of Ald. Lucas, Council adjourned.

Isaac G. Reynolds, City Clerk.